Ref: FOI1/2023/8847

Date Received: 24" April 2023

Response Due: 24" May 2023

Date: 5" May 2023

Dear Sir/Madam

You asked:

NHS

Wrightington, Wigan and
Leigh Teaching Hospitals

NHS Foundation Trust

Information Governance Department
Suite 9

Buckingham Row

Brick Kiln Lane

Wigan

WN1 1XX

Email: foi@wwl.nhs.uk
Web: www.wwl.nhs.uk

Please could | request the following information under the Freedom of Information Act. for
the Leigh Infirmary

1. The total number of new patients with diagnosed Sleep Apnoea, that have been set up
on Continuous Positive Airway Pressure (CPAP) devices within the period 1st April 2022
to 31st March 2023?

We do not record data in this way; therefore, the results would not be accurate.

2. Alist of the CPAP devices suppliers used by the hospital, with total quantity of devices
purchased from each supplier between 1st April 2022 to 31st March 20237

Site Supplier Total

Leigh AMBU UK LTD 7
COOKUKLTD 1
DRAEGER MEDICAL 5
FANNIN UK LTD 17
FLEXICARE MEDICAL LTD 12
FREELANCE SURGICAL LIMITED 1
GENX MEDICARE LTD 1




HEALTHCARE 21 UK LTD 31

INTERSURGICAL LTD 112
KAPITEX HEALTHCARE LTD 7
MEDLINE INDUSTRIES LTD 10
PROACT MEDICAL LTD 34

SMITHS MEDICAL INTERNATIONAL LTD 192

TELEFLEX MEDICAL (RUSCH & PILLING 10

WECK)

TIMESCO HEALTHCARE LTD 5

VERATHON MEDICAL 1
Leigh 446
Infirmary
Total

3. As of the date of this request, how many patients diagnosed with sleep apnoea are on the
waiting list for setup on CPAP therapy?

We do not record data in this way; therefore, the results would not be accurate.

Please could | request the following information under the Freedom of Information Act. for the The
Royal Albert Edward Infirmary

1. The total number of new patients with diagnosed Sleep Apnoea, that have been set up
on Continuous Positive Airway Pressure (CPAP) devices within the period 1st April 2022
to 31st March 2023?

We do not record data in this way; therefore, the results would not be accurate.

2. Alist of the CPAP devices suppliers used by the hospital, with total quantity of devices
purchased from each supplier between 1st April 2022 to 31st March 2023?

Site Supplier Total
RAEI AMBU UK LTD 19
ARMSTRONG MEDICAL LTD 2
ATOS MEDICAL (UK) 2
AVANOS MEDICAL UK LIMITED 8




BPR MEDICAL LIMITED

25

CAPATEX LTD 3
COOK (UK) LTD 4
DRAEGER MEDICAL 76
FANNIN UK LTD 113
FISHER & PAYKEL HEALTHCARE LTD | 52
FLEXICARE MEDICAL LTD 16
FREELANCE SURGICAL LIMITED 1
GENX MEDICARE LTD 4
HEALTHCARE 21 UK LTD 478
INSIGHT MEDICAL PRODUCTS 111
LIMITED
INTERSURGICAL LTD 1295
KAPITEX HEALTHCARE LTD 100
MARSHALL PRODUCTS 1
MEDITECH SYSTEMS LTD (DORSET) 1
P3 MEDICAL LIMITED 3
PENNINE HEALTHCARE EDIRECT 1
PROACT MEDICAL LTD 391
SMITHS MEDICAL INTERNATIONAL 2662
LTD
STRYKER UK LTD 1
TELEFLEX MEDICAL (RUSCH & 103
PILLING WECK)
TIMESCO HEALTHCARE LTD 3
VERATHON MEDICAL 33
VYAIRE MEDICAL PRODUCTS LTD 1
RAEI 5509

Total




3. As of the date of this request, how many patients diagnosed with sleep apnoea are on the
waiting list for setup on CPAP therapy?

We do not record data in this way; therefore, the results would not be accurate.

If you are not entirely satisfied with this response, please do not hesitate to contact the Information
Governance Department via the email address provided. If we do not hear from you within 40 days, we
will assume that we have been able to accommodate your request under the Freedom of Information Act
2000.

Yours sincerely,

Tabitha Gardner
Chief Finance Officer

PLEASE NOTE:

If you are unhappy with the service you have received in relation to your request and wish to make a
complaint or request a review of our decision, you should write to: Information Governance Department,
Wrightington, Wigan and Leigh NHS Foundation Trust, Suite 9, Buckingham Row, Brick Kiln Lane, Wigan,
WNL1 1XX.

If you are not content with the outcome of your complaint, you may apply directly to the Information
Commissioner for a decision at:

The Information Commissioner’s Office
Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire, SK9 5AF

Helpline number: 0303 123 111



